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Background:

There is limited intelligence about the existence of Adult NHS Counselling & Psychotherapy Services across Scotland. In 1997 The Aberdeen University Health Services Research Unit (led by Simon Naji) conducted a survey across Scotland focusing on the qualifications of counsellors providing NHS Services. Since then major changes have taken place which have impacted on the structure & delivery of counselling & psychotherapy services, in particular in Primary Care where most BACP members of BACP have been employed in this sector (such as the move from fund holding GP Practices to Local Healthcare Co-operatives and more recently to Community Healthcare Partnerships).

 In 2008 the Artemis Trust conducted a systematic mapping of Primary Care Psychological Therapy Services across the UK. However the data gathered was not disaggregated for meaningful understanding of Scottish specific services.

In 2009 NHS Education in Scotland’s (NES) Information Service Division published Workforce Planning for Psychology Services in NHS Scotland.  The report identified 18.4 whole time equivalent Counsellors employed in Scottish Psychology Services.
Information on counselling service provision is clearly limited and this has made the task of campaigning for increased resources challenging. This mapping of Scottish Adult NHS Counselling Services was conducted in order to establish a fuller picture of current service provision. Additionally it was thought that by having this information it would help provide more information about BACP members’ employment opportunities.

The survey would also provide a benchmark measure to monitor service changes in relation to Scottish Health Department initiatives on increasing access to Psychological Therapies particularly in relation to the NES Matrix Of Psychological Therapy Services (2008), the recent revision of SIGN Guidance on Non Pharmacological Treatment for Depression (2010) and the new HEAT target on access to Psychological therapies to be announced in October 2010.

Furthermore it was considered that by having up-to-date information that this would help better position counselling as a useful resource in working strategically with the Scottish Health Department and NES in achieving the HEAT target of accessing Psychological Therapies.
Method:

Due to limited resources, the mapping was conducted in a naturalistic rather than systematic way. BACP members were contacted through the quarterly BACP Scottish E-Bulletin in December 2009 (audience of approx 1,200 BACP members). Additionally a post was placed in Person Centred Therapy Scotland weekly e-bulletin over a 10-week period (audience of approx 250 members). Twenty-three Managers of Scottish Children & Young People’s Counselling Services were asked to forward the information to relevant colleagues/services known locally. 
Through previously accumulated contact details, known Scottish NHS Counselling Service Managers were approached directly by e-mail.  Additionally at a number of member presentations, the Lead Advisor requested that those present contact him directly or forward his query to any colleagues working in the relevant areas.
Identified services/individuals were requested to provide the following information:

i) Numbers of whole time equivalent employed counsellors 
ii) Total number of clients seen in a year 
iii) Average waiting times for accessing counselling.
Results:

Contact was successfully made with 21 services/individual practitioners covering 11 (of 14) Scottish Health Board areas. Ten services were identified whilst the other information was provided by individual practitioners. 
Services in Health Board areas not identified include Forth Valley, Orkney and Tayside.  (Though a range of voluntary services operating in these areas were identified but they were beyond the scope of this exercise).  Additional information was supplied by an NHS Staff Counselling Service but the figures were not included as the focus of the exercise was to determine services accessible by the general population.
Information for all three areas was provided by 13 services/individuals as shown below:
 Nos of WTE counsellors:      Nos of clients seen per annum:       Average waiting times:
19.35



   3,931



33 weeks 

Partial information supplied by a further eight services/individuals show the following:

Nos of WTE counsellors:      Nos of clients seen per annum:       Average waiting times:
 
43.1



 2,685



22 weeks
(Five of the above services/individuals did not have a record of clients seen in their services in a year whilst four had no recorded information about waiting times)

Total of above combined:
62.45 (wte) counsellors

6,616 clients/annum
       
27.5 weeks average wait
Four relatively large services (including approx 27 wte counsellors) were unable to give exact numbers of clients seen in a year at time of writing, so estimates were calculated below based upon the amount of whole time counselling equivalent hours, and assuming services offering an average of six sessions for each client and the assumption that a full-time counsellor offering approx 22 client contact hours per week over a 46-week working year.

Estimated numbers of clients receiving counselling by identified services:

10,554 clients per annum by 62.45 wte equivalent employed counsellors.
Waiting times varied across sectors and services from 2.5 weeks to up to 33 weeks with the shortest  times being achieved mostly in urban services.  
Discussion:
This has been a challenging exercise for a variety of reasons:  Scottish NHS Counselling Services have no clear and consistent structures across the country.  Within individual Health Board areas there are no clear ways to identify those employed in a counselling capacity. 

Models of delivery differ from stand-alone counselling services to individual practitioners contracted to work a few hours per week at GP practices, to services delivered as part of integrated multidisciplinary teams, many of these operating from a stepped-care perspective. Some areas have counsellors employed as part of wider Community Mental Health Teams (working along with psychologists, CB therapists, guided self-help workers, occupational therapists, CPNs and support workers) and this, therefore, makes it difficult to identify specific waiting times for just counselling, as these services measure waiting times for access to the team rather than for specific interventions. 
Other areas have GP practices which employ counsellors directly. In the areas with no employed counsellors, it appears that local voluntary counselling agencies are used as a way of referring patients. (In one particular Health Board area, it appears that all counselling is provided by voluntary sector services. In another it appears that the Health Board is planning to enter into service level agreements with specific voluntary agencies rather than employing counsellors). 
At time of writing two services were facing significant challenges: one facing decommissioning after 15 years whilst the other facing structural changes to incorporate a range of approaches (which follows the stepped-care model as outlined in the Matrix).
The figures above are by no means comprehensive, and the exercise has demonstrated that some individual counsellors/services do not routinely monitor information such as numbers of clients seen in a year or waiting times and so were unable to provide this. 
Recommendations:
This initial mapping has identified a clear lack of information about NHS counselling and psychotherapy services that exist across Scotland. The report, however, does provide a firm beginning. Due to the pressures on counselling services through Matrix, SIGN and potentially by the forthcoming Heat target this is a constantly changing landscape and will need to be reviewed regularly.

A more systematic approach is needed to have a more detailed picture. Freedom of Information requests to each of the Health Boards may result in more information but holds no guarantees as the experience of the current author suggests that this information is not held centrally by any one department as one might expect eg Human Resources.  
Another medium to gather the information would be through a direct postal mailing to all Scottish BACP members. There may be some sensitivity about information such as waiting times being made available, so the purpose of the survey would need to be clarified with relevant Service Managers. Additionally BACP Healthcare may wish to consider commissioning a simple toolkit for individual members enabling them to routinely audit their data on service usage etc. It may then be possible to gather this data annually.
 Depending upon the finalised Heat Target for access to psychological therapy services this may offer the opportunity to identify more services/individuals. Additionally the author understands that Audit Scotland is planning to conduct more research into accessing psychological therapy services following their work on waiting times for accessing Mental Health Services across Scotland published in May 2009.
An additional method to gather useful data would be by compiling CORE Data from the Scottish services which subscribe to this tool so that data generated using practice-based evidence would  help to provide a more comprehensive picture to supplement the resources identified. 

Due to the close working between some Health Boards with voluntary counselling agencies these would need to be included in further scoping so that a more comprehensive picture can be drawn. 
The author understands, through informal contact with a member, that NES are currently exploring surveying psychological therapy services across Scotland in advance of the new Heat Target. It is not clear at this point if this would include counselling services which exist out with of psychology departments, and the author is awaiting a response from NES on this matter.
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